
Pair: 1     Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley Green

Your Posn is  5 with  40 % Top Score =  100

Board Contract By Opponents Tricks Score Points

1 2 NT   N Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 8 -120 0.00

2 2 ]   S Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 5 300 4.00

3 2 NT   E Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 11 210 0.00

4 1 NT   N Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 8 -120 2.00

5 4 ]   W Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 9 -50 3.00

6 4 ]   E Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 11 -650 4.00

7 4 ]   S Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 10 620 4.00

8 3 [   E Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 8 50 4.00

9 1 }   E Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 7 -70 0.00

10 2 NT   N Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 5 -300 0.00

11 4 ]   E Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 11 450 2.00

12 3 }   N Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 9 -110 1.00

13 1 NT   S Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 5 200 4.00

14 2 {   W Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 10 130 2.00

15 3 {   W Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 10 130 2.00

16 2 NT   E Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 8 120 2.00

17 3 NT   N Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 10 -430 0.00

18 4 [   S Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 11 -650 1.00

19 2 ]   W Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 9 140 0.00

20 3 }   E Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 10 130 0.00

21 4 [   E Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 10 -420 0.00

22 3 }   N Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 11 150 0.00

23 2 NT   W Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 9 -150 0.00

24 2 ]   S Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 7 -50 3.00

25 2 ]   E Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 9 -140 2.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 40.00

Factored Total: 40.00

* Arrow switched table
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Pair: 2     Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns Green

Your Posn is  5 with  40 % Top Score =  100

Board Contract By Opponents Tricks Score Points

1 1 NT   S Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 7 -90 2.00

2 2 ]   W Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 9 140 0.00

3 4 [   E Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 11 650 3.00

4 3 [   S Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 9 -140 0.00

5 4 ]   W Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 9 -50 3.00

6 4 ]   E Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 12 680 3.00

7 6 }   N Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 9 300 3.00

8 2 ]   S Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 6 100 2.00

9 3 NT   S Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 9 -400 0.00

10 1 { X W Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 6 -200 0.00

11 4 ]   E Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 11 -450 2.00

12 3 }   N Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 9 110 3.00

13 1 NT   S Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 5 -200 0.00

14 2 {   W Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 10 -130 2.00

15 3 {   W Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 10 -130 2.00

16 1 NT   E Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 9 -150 0.00

17 4 [   N Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 10 420 2.00

18 4 [   S Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 11 650 3.00

19 2 ]   W Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 10 -170 0.00

20 4 ]   E Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 10 -620 2.00

21 2 ]   E Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 10 170 2.00

22 3 NT   S Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 10 -430 1.00

23 Jan Kelly & Linda Anania No Bid 1.00

24 2 {   W Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 8 90 4.00

25 3 }   N Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 8 50 0.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 40.00

Factored Total: 40.00

* Arrow switched table

Page  2Printed 10/10/2023 Bridge Scoring Software V3.2.6

PLAYER SUMMARY TUE231010G - Tue Evening Green - 10th Oct 2023 9/10/2023



Pair: 3     Jan Kelly & Linda Anania Green

Your Posn is  1 with  61 % Top Score =  100

Board Contract By Opponents Tricks Score Points

1 3 NT   N Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 8 50 4.00

2 2 NT   W Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 9 150 2.00

3 4 [   E Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 11 650 3.00

4 1 NT   N Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 6 100 4.00

5 3 }   S Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 11 -150 0.00

6 4 ]   E Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 12 680 3.00

7 6 NT   N Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 9 300 3.00

8 2 [   E Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 8 110 4.00

9 2 ]   E Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 6 -200 2.00

10 1 NT   N Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 6 100 2.00

11 4 ]   E Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 11 450 2.00

12 3 }   S Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 9 -110 1.00

13 1 NT   S Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 6 100 2.00

14 2 ]   W Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 8 110 0.00

15 2 [   N Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 8 -110 0.00

16 2 NT   E Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 8 -120 2.00

17 3 NT   N Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 10 430 4.00

18 4 [   S Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 11 650 3.00

19 2 ]   W Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 9 -140 4.00

20 3 }   E Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 10 -130 4.00

21 2 ]   E Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 10 -170 2.00

22 3 NT   S Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 10 430 3.00

23 Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns No Bid 3.00

24 2 {   W Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 8 -90 0.00

25 3 }   N Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 8 -50 4.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 61.00

Factored Total: 61.00

* Arrow switched table
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Pair: 4     Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne Green

Your Posn is  1 with  61 % Top Score =  100

Board Contract By Opponents Tricks Score Points

1 1 NT   S Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 7 90 2.00

2 2 ]   W Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 9 -140 4.00

3 4 [   E Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 11 -650 1.00

4 3 [   S Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 9 140 4.00

5 4 ]   W Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 9 50 1.00

6 4 ]   E Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 12 -680 1.00

7 6 NT   N Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 9 -300 1.00

8 2 [   E Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 8 -110 0.00

9 2 ]   E Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 6 200 2.00

10 1 NT   N Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 6 -100 2.00

11 4 ]   E Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 11 450 2.00

12 3 ]   E Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 8 -50 4.00

13 1 NT   S Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 7 -90 0.00

14 4 ]   W Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 10 420 4.00

15 3 [ X N Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 7 500 4.00

16 Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou No Bid 0.00

17 3 NT   N Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 8 50 4.00

18 4 [   S Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 10 -620 4.00

19 4 [   S Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 7 150 2.00

20 4 ]   E Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 11 650 4.00

21 4 [   E Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 10 420 4.00

22 3 }   N Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 11 -150 4.00

23 2 NT   W Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 9 150 4.00

24 2 ]   S Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 7 50 1.00

25 2 ]   E Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 9 140 2.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 61.00

Factored Total: 61.00

* Arrow switched table
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Pair: 5     Roger Dadd & Diane Murray Green

Your Posn is  4 with  40.99 % Top Score =  100

Board Contract By Opponents Tricks Score Points

1 3 NT   N Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 8 -50 0.00

2 2 NT   W Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 9 -150 2.00

3 4 [   E Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 11 -650 1.00

4 1 NT   N Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 6 -100 0.00

5 3 }   S Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 11 150 4.00

6 4 ]   E Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 11 650 0.00

7 4 ]   S Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 10 -620 0.00

8 3 [   E Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 8 -50 0.00

9 1 }   E Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 7 70 4.00

10 2 NT   N Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 5 300 4.00

11 4 ]   E Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 11 -450 2.00

12 3 ]   E Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 8 50 0.00

13 1 NT   S Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 7 90 4.00

14 4 ]   W Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 10 -420 0.00

15 3 [ X N Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 7 -500 0.00

16 1 NT   E Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 9 150 4.00

17 4 [   N Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 10 -420 2.00

18 4 [   S Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 11 -650 1.00

19 2 ]   W Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 10 170 4.00

20 4 ]   E Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 10 620 2.00

21 3 ]   E Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 9 140 0.00

22 3 NT   S Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 10 -430 1.00

23 Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou No Bid 1.00

24 2 ]   S Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 7 50 1.00

25 3 ]   E Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou 11 200 4.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 41.00

Factored Total: 41.00

* Arrow switched table
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Pair: 6     Mark Rosenow & Lef Lazarou Green

Your Posn is  3 with  56.99 % Top Score =  100

Board Contract By Opponents Tricks Score Points

1 2 NT   N Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 8 120 4.00

2 2 ]   S Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 5 -300 0.00

3 2 NT   E Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 11 -210 4.00

4 1 NT   N Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 8 120 2.00

5 4 ]   W Keith Shimmen & Ros Critchley 9 50 1.00

6 4 ]   E Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 12 -680 1.00

7 6 }   N Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 9 -300 1.00

8 2 ]   S Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 6 -100 2.00

9 3 NT   S Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 9 400 4.00

10 1 { X W Marie Wallis & Colleen Cairns 6 200 4.00

11 4 ]   E Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 11 -450 2.00

12 3 }   S Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 9 110 3.00

13 1 NT   S Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 6 -100 2.00

14 2 ]   W Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 8 -110 4.00

15 2 [   N Jan Kelly & Linda Anania 8 110 4.00

16 Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne No Bid 4.00

17 3 NT   N Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 8 -50 0.00

18 4 [   S Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 10 620 0.00

19 4 [   S Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 7 -150 2.00

20 4 ]   E Sonia Bihun & Matt Byrne 11 -650 0.00

21 3 ]   E Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 9 -140 4.00

22 3 NT   S Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 10 430 3.00

23 Roger Dadd & Diane Murray No Bid 3.00

24 2 ]   S Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 7 -50 3.00

25 3 ]   E Roger Dadd & Diane Murray 11 -200 0.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 57.00

Factored Total: 57.00

* Arrow switched table
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