

Pair: 1 Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin Blue

Your Posn is 5 with 51.11 % Top Score = 270

Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points
1	2 ♥	S	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	5	150	8.00
2	3 ♠	N	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	8	100	2.00
3	3 ♦	E	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	9	110	9.00
4	2 ♠	N	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	11	200	9.00
5	3 NT	S	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	12	690	7.00
6	2 ♠	W	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	6	200	5.00
7	3 NT	E	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	10	-630	1.00
8	3 NT	S	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	7	-100	0.00
9	2 ♠	S	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	9	140	8.00
10	3 ♣	N	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	10	-130	2.00
11	4 ♥	S	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	11	-450	4.00
12	3 ♣	W	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	8	-50	10.00
13	2 ♦	E	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	9	-110	6.00
14	4 NT	W	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	11	-460	2.00
15	3 ♣	S	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	11	150	4.00
16	1 NT	E	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	7	-90	6.00
17	2 ♠	E	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	8	-110	4.00
18	3 ♠	W	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	10	-170	5.00
19	2 ♠	N	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	10	-170	4.00
20			Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison		No Bid	4.00
21	4 ♠	E	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	9	-50	5.00
22	2 ♣	E	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	9	110	4.00
23	3 ♥	S	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	7	200	8.00
24	2 ♥	E	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	8	110	10.00
25	2 NT	S	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	9	-150	2.00
26	2 ♠	E	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	8	110	4.00
27	1 NT	N	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	6	50	5.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 138.00

Factored Total: 138.00

* Arrow switched table

Pair: 2 Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson						Blue	
Your Posn is 8 with 48.88 %						Top Score = 270	
Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points	
1	1 NT	S	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	7	-90	2.00	
2	3 ♠	N	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	8	100	2.00	
3	4 ♦	E	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	9	-100	6.00	
4	4 ♦	E	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	9	-100	6.00	
5	4 ♥	N	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	12	-680	7.00	
6	3 ♠	W	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	7	-200	5.00	
7	1 NT	E	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	9	-150	10.00	
8	2 ♥	N	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	9	140	6.00	
9	3 ♠	S	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	9	140	8.00	
10	4 ♥	N	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	8	-200	1.00	
11	4 ♥	S	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	12	480	10.00	
12	2 ♠	N	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	11	200	5.00	
13	2 ♦	E	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	9	110	4.00	
14	3 NT	W	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	11	460	8.00	
15	3 ♥	W	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	4	-250	4.00	
16	1 NT	S	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	5	-100	4.00	
17	3 ♠	E	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	10	-170	0.00	
18	3 ♠	W	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	10	-170	5.00	
19	3 NT	N	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	7	-100	0.00	
20	3 ♥	W	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	7	200	10.00	
21	5 ♠ X	E	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	10	100	8.00	
22	4 ♥	W	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	11	650	10.00	
23	3 ♥	S	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	6	300	10.00	
24	1 NT	N	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	8	-120	0.00	
25	1 NT	S	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	7	90	1.00	
26	1 NT	E	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	10	-180	0.00	
27	3 NT	S	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	5	-200	0.00	
Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable):						132.00	
Factored Total:						132.00	

* Arrow switched table

Pair: 3 Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady Blue

Your Posn is 4 with 52.59 % Top Score = 270

Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points
1	2 ♦	W	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	7	50	6.00
2	3 ♥	E	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	9	-140	4.00
3	3 ♠	N	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	9	140	6.00
4	4 ♠ X	N	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	9	200	8.00
5	4 ♠ X	E	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	6	-800	0.00
6	4 ♥	N	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	11	-450	1.00
7	3 NT	E	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	10	630	9.00
8	1 ♥	N	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	9	-140	4.00
9	3 ♠	S	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	7	100	8.00
10	3 ♣	N	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	10	130	8.00
11	4 ♥	S	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	11	450	6.00
12	3 ♣	W	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	8	50	0.00
13	2 ♥	W	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	10	-170	2.00
14	3 NT	E	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	11	-460	2.00
15	4 ♠	S	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	12	680	10.00
16	2 ♦	W	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	9	110	8.00
17	3 ♣	N	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	7	100	4.00
18	3 ♠	W	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	10	170	5.00
19	1 ♥	N	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	7	-80	8.00
20	3 NT	W	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	10	630	10.00
21	4 ♠	E	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	10	420	10.00
22	1 ♦	E	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	6	100	10.00
23	2 NT	W	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	8	-120	4.00
24	3 ♠	S	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	7	-100	4.00
25	2 ♠	S	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	8	-110	4.00
26	1 NT	E	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	7	90	0.00
27	2 ♠	N	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	8	-110	1.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 142.00

Factored Total: 142.00

* Arrow switched table

Pair: 4 Roger Dadd & Diane Murray Blue

Your Posn is 2 with 57.4 % Top Score = 270

Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points
1	2 ♥ X	W	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	8	470	10.00
2	2 ♦	S	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	5	300	10.00
3	3 ♦	E	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	9	110	9.00
4	1 NT	W	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	5	-200	1.00
5	4 ♥	S	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	12	-680	7.00
6	3 ♥	N	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	10	-170	8.00
7	3 NT	E	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	9	600	4.00
8	1 ♥	N	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	9	-140	4.00
9	2 ♣	E	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	8	90	6.00
10	3 NT	N	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	8	100	5.00
11	4 ♥	S	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	11	-450	4.00
12	3 ♠	S	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	11	-200	5.00
13	2 ♦	E	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	9	-110	6.00
14	3 NT	W	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	11	-460	2.00
15	3 ♥	W	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	4	250	6.00
16	2 ♣	E	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	6	200	10.00
17	3 ♠	E	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	8	50	8.00
18	3 ♠	W	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	9	-140	10.00
19	4 ♠	N	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	10	-420	1.00
20	3 ♥	N	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	7	200	8.00
21	4 ♠	E	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	9	-50	5.00
22			Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen		No Bid	2.00
23	2 ♠	W	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	7	-100	3.00
24	1 NT	N	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	6	50	2.00
25	2 NT	S	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	9	150	8.00
26	2 ♠	E	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	8	-110	6.00
27	1 NT	N	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	6	-50	5.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 155.00

Factored Total: 155.00

* Arrow switched table

Pair: 5 Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison						Blue	
Your Posn is 6 with 50.37 %						Top Score = 270	
Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points	
1	1 NT	S	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	7	90	8.00	
2	3 ♠	N	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	8	-100	8.00	
3	4 ♦	E	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	9	100	4.00	
4	4 ♠	N	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	7	300	10.00	
5	4 ♥	S	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	11	-650	10.00	
6	4 ♥	N	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	11	-450	1.00	
7	3 NT	E	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	9	600	4.00	
8	3 NT	S	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	9	-400	0.00	
9	3 ♠	S	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	9	-140	2.00	
10	3 NT	N	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	8	100	5.00	
11	2 ♥	S	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	9	-140	10.00	
12	4 ♠	S	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	11	-650	1.00	
13	1 ♦	E	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	9	110	4.00	
14	5 ♦	E	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	12	420	0.00	
15	2 ♦	E	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	7	-50	10.00	
16	2 ♦	W	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	9	-110	2.00	
17	3 ♣	N	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	7	-100	6.00	
18	3 ♠	W	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	10	-170	5.00	
19	2 ♠	N	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	10	170	6.00	
20			Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin		No Bid	6.00	
21	4 ♠	E	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	9	50	5.00	
22	2 ♥	W	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	10	170	8.00	
23	2 ♠	W	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	7	-100	3.00	
24	2 NT	N	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	6	100	6.00	
25	1 NT	S	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	7	90	1.00	
26	1 ♠	E	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	8	-110	6.00	
27	2 ♠	N	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	7	-50	5.00	
Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable):						136.00	
Factored Total:						136.00	

* Arrow switched table

Pair: 6 Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun Blue

Your Posn is 3 with 55.92 % Top Score = 270

Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points
1	2 NT	S	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	8	120	10.00
2	4 ♠	N	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	8	-200	2.00
3	4 ♥	S	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	10	420	10.00
4	4 ♠ X	N	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	9	-200	2.00
5	4 ♠ X	E	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	6	800	10.00
6	4 ♥	N	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	11	450	9.00
7	3 NT	E	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	10	630	9.00
8	3 NT	S	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	7	100	10.00
9	2 ♠	S	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	9	-140	2.00
10	3 NT	N	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	10	-630	0.00
11	3 NT	S	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	10	-430	8.00
12	4 ♠	S	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	11	-650	1.00
13	3 ♠	N	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	8	100	0.00
14	3 NT	W	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	10	430	2.00
15	4 ♣	S	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	10	-130	8.00
16	1 NT	W	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	8	120	10.00
17	4 ♠	E	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	8	-100	0.00
18	4 ♠	W	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	10	420	10.00
19	4 ♠	N	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	10	420	9.00
20	3 ♥	N	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	7	-200	2.00
21	4 ♠	E	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	9	50	5.00
22	4 ♥	W	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	11	-650	0.00
23	3 ♥	S	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	6	-300	0.00
24	1 NT	N	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	8	120	10.00
25	1 NT	E	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	6	-100	6.00
26	1 NT	E	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	8	120	8.00
27	2 ♠ X	N	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	7	100	8.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 151.00

Factored Total: 151.00

* Arrow switched table

Pair: 7 Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg Blue

Your Posn is 6 with 50.37 % Top Score = 270

Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points
1	2 NT X	S	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	7	100	6.00
2	3 ♠	N	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	8	100	2.00
3	4 ♦	E	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	8	-200	2.00
4	3 ♠	S	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	9	140	6.00
5	3 NT	N	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	12	690	7.00
6	3 ♠	W	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	8	100	0.00
7	3 NT	E	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	9	-600	6.00
8	1 ♥	N	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	9	140	6.00
9	2 ♣	E	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	8	-90	4.00
10	4 ♥	N	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	8	200	9.00
11	4 ♥	S	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	12	-480	0.00
12	2 ♠	N	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	11	-200	5.00
13	4 ♠	N	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	8	-200	0.00
14	5 ♦	E	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	13	-440	6.00
15	3 NT	S	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	11	660	8.00
16	1 NT	E	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	7	90	4.00
17	2 ♠	E	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	8	110	6.00
18	3 ♠	W	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	10	170	5.00
19	3 ♠	N	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	9	-140	6.00
20	2 NT	E	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	7	-100	2.00
21	3 ♠	E	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	9	140	8.00
22	2 ♥	W	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	10	-170	2.00
23	2 ♠	W	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	7	100	7.00
24	2 NT	N	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	6	-100	4.00
25	2 ♠	S	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	8	110	6.00
26	1 NT	E	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	7	-90	10.00
27	2 ♠	N	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	8	110	9.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 136.00

Factored Total: 136.00

* Arrow switched table

Pair: 8 Janet Watson & Brian Luxford Blue

Your Posn is 11 with 40.37 % Top Score = 270

Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points
1	2 ♥ X	W	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	8	-470	0.00
2	2 ♦	S	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	5	-300	0.00
3	3 ♦	E	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	9	-110	1.00
4	2 ♠	N	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	11	-200	1.00
5	3 NT	S	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	12	-690	3.00
6	2 ♠	W	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	6	-200	5.00
7	3 NT	E	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	9	600	4.00
8	2 ♥	N	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	7	50	8.00
9	2 ♦ X	N	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	4	800	10.00
10	3 NT	N	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	8	-100	5.00
11	2 ♥	S	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	9	140	0.00
12	4 ♠	S	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	11	650	9.00
13	2 ♥	W	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	10	170	8.00
14	3 NT	E	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	11	460	8.00
15	4 ♠	S	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	12	-680	0.00
16	3 NT	E	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	8	100	8.00
17	3 ♠	E	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	9	-140	2.00
18	2 ♠	W	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	10	-170	5.00
19	3 NT	N	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	7	100	10.00
20	3 ♥	W	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	7	-200	0.00
21	5 ♠ X	E	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	10	-100	2.00
22	3 ♥	W	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	9	140	6.00
23	3 ♠	W	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	6	-300	0.00
24	1 NT	N	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	5	100	6.00
25	1 NT	E	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	6	100	4.00
26	1 NT	E	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	8	-120	2.00
27	2 ♠ X	N	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	7	-100	2.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 109.00

Factored Total: 109.00

* Arrow switched table

Pair: 9 Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo Blue

Your Posn is 12 with 37.77 % Top Score = 270

Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points
1	2 NT X	S	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	7	-100	4.00
2	3 ♠	N	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	8	-100	8.00
3	4 ♦	E	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	8	200	8.00
4	4 ♠	N	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	7	-300	0.00
5	4 ♥	S	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	11	650	0.00
6	4 ♥	N	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	11	450	9.00
7	1 NT	E	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	9	150	0.00
8	2 ♥	N	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	9	-140	4.00
9	3 ♠	S	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	9	-140	2.00
10	4 ♥	N	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	8	200	9.00
11	4 ♥	S	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	11	-450	4.00
12	4 ♣	W	Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen	8	-100	8.00
13	3 ♠	N	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	8	-100	10.00
14	3 NT	W	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	10	-430	8.00
15	4 ♣	S	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	10	130	2.00
16	2 ♣	E	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	6	-200	0.00
17	3 ♠	E	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	8	-50	2.00
18	3 ♠	W	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	9	140	0.00
19	4 ♠	N	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	10	-420	1.00
20	2 ♥	N	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	7	100	6.00
21	4 ♥	S	Mark Rosenow & John Witte	12	-680	0.00
22	1 ♦	E	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	6	-100	0.00
23	2 NT	W	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	8	120	6.00
24	3 ♠	S	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	7	100	6.00
25	3 ♥	E	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	7	-200	0.00
26	1 ♠	E	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	8	110	4.00
27	2 ♠	N	Marie Wallis & Liz Madden	8	-110	1.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 102.00

Factored Total: 102.00

* Arrow switched table

Pair: 10 Ros Critchley & Keith Shimmen Blue

Your Posn is 10 with 45.92 % Top Score = 270

Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points
1	2 NT	S	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	8	-120	0.00
2	4 ♠	N	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	8	200	8.00
3	4 ♥	S	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	10	-420	0.00
4	3 ♠	S	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	9	-140	4.00
5	3 NT	N	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	12	-690	3.00
6	3 ♠	W	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	8	-100	10.00
7	3 NT	E	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	9	-600	6.00
8	2 ♥	N	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	7	-50	2.00
9	2 ♦ X	N	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	4	-800	0.00
10	4 ♥	N	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	8	-200	1.00
11	4 ♥	S	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	11	450	6.00
12	4 ♣	W	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	8	100	2.00
13	2 ♦	E	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	9	110	4.00
14	4 NT	W	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	11	460	8.00
15	3 ♣	S	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	11	-150	6.00
16	1 NT	S	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	5	100	6.00
17	3 ♠	E	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	10	170	10.00
18	3 ♠	W	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	10	170	5.00
19	1 ♥	N	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	7	80	2.00
20	3 NT	W	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	10	-630	0.00
21	4 ♠	E	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	10	-420	0.00
22			Roger Dadd & Diane Murray		No Bid	8.00
23	2 ♠	W	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	7	100	7.00
24	1 NT	N	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	6	-50	8.00
25	1 NT	S	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	7	-90	9.00
26	1 ♠	E	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	8	110	4.00
27	2 ♠	N	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	7	50	5.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 124.00

Factored Total: 124.00

* Arrow switched table

Pair: 11 Mark Rosenow & John Witte Blue

Your Posn is 1 with 60.74 % Top Score = 270

Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points
1	2 ♦	W	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	7	-50	4.00
2	3 ♥	E	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	9	140	6.00
3	3 ♠	N	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	9	-140	4.00
4	1 NT	W	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	5	200	9.00
5	4 ♥	S	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	12	680	3.00
6	3 ♥	N	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	10	170	2.00
7	3 NT	E	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	9	-600	6.00
8	3 NT	S	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	9	400	10.00
9	3 ♠	S	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	9	140	8.00
10	3 NT	N	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	10	630	10.00
11	3 NT	S	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	10	430	2.00
12	4 ♠	S	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	11	650	9.00
13	4 ♠	N	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	8	200	10.00
14	5 ♦	E	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	13	440	4.00
15	3 NT	S	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	11	-660	2.00
16	3 NT	E	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	8	-100	2.00
17	3 ♠	E	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	9	140	8.00
18	2 ♠	W	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	10	170	5.00
19	4 ♠	N	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	10	420	9.00
20	2 ♥	N	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	7	-100	4.00
21	4 ♥	S	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	12	680	10.00
22	2 ♣	E	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	9	-110	6.00
23	3 ♥	S	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	7	-200	2.00
24	2 ♥	E	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	8	-110	0.00
25	1 NT	S	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	7	-90	9.00
26	1 NT	E	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	10	180	10.00
27	3 NT	S	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	5	200	10.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 164.00

Factored Total: 164.00

* Arrow switched table

Pair: 12 Marie Wallis & Liz Madden Blue

Your Posn is 9 with 48.51 % Top Score = 270

Board	Contract	By	Opponents	Tricks	Score	Points
1	2 ♥	S	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	5	-150	2.00
2	3 ♠	N	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	8	-100	8.00
3	3 ♦	E	Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin	9	-110	1.00
4	4 ♦	E	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	9	100	4.00
5	4 ♥	N	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	12	680	3.00
6	3 ♠	W	Jan Kelly & Judith Thomson	7	200	5.00
7	3 NT	E	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	10	-630	1.00
8	1 ♥	N	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	9	140	6.00
9	3 ♠	S	Mike Glenister & Hugh Grady	7	-100	2.00
10	3 NT	N	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	8	-100	5.00
11	4 ♥	S	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	11	450	6.00
12	3 ♠	S	Roger Dadd & Diane Murray	11	200	5.00
13	1 ♦	E	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	9	-110	6.00
14	5 ♦	E	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	12	-420	10.00
15	2 ♦	E	Colleen Cairns & Robyn Harrison	7	50	0.00
16	1 NT	W	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	8	-120	0.00
17	4 ♠	E	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	8	100	10.00
18	4 ♠	W	Sandra Smith & Sonia Bihun	10	-420	0.00
19	3 ♠	N	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	9	140	4.00
20	2 NT	E	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	7	100	8.00
21	3 ♠	E	Paul Thomas & Marika Van Stekelenberg	9	-140	2.00
22	3 ♥	W	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	9	-140	4.00
23	3 ♠	W	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	6	300	10.00
24	1 NT	N	Janet Watson & Brian Luxford	5	-100	4.00
25	3 ♥	E	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	7	200	10.00
26	1 ♠	E	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	8	-110	6.00
27	2 ♠	N	Jean Kirkwood & Bev Fermo	8	110	9.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 131.00

Factored Total: 131.00

* Arrow switched table