PLAYER SUMMARY FRM231201B - Fri Morning Blue - 1st Dec 2023 1/12/2023

Pair: 1 Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien
Your Posn is 6 with 43.75 % Top Score = 144
Board | Contract |By |Opponents Tricks | Score Points

1 5 & S | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 10 50 2.00
2 3 NT X S | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 6 800 6.00
3 2 NT W | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 11 210 6.00
4 2 & E | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 9 -140 3.00
5 3 & E | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 10 -130 1.00
6 3 & W | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 9 -110 2.00
7 3 NT N | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 7 200 2.00
8 4 0 S | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 9 50 2.00
9 1 & X N | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 7 -160 0.00
10 1 NT W | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 6 -100 6.00
11 3 NT W | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 9 400 6.00
12 2 & E | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 9 140 2.00
13 3 ¢ S | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 12 170 2.00
14 1 & N | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 7 80 2.00
15 1 NT W | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 9 -150 2.00
16 6 NT W | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 11 -100 1.00
17 2 & S | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 9 -140 2.00
18 3 NT E | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 10 430 5.00
19 3 NT W | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 13 -720 2.00
20 4 & E | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 11 -650 0.00
21 29 E | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 8 -90 0.00
25 4 9Q N | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 10 -420 2.00
26 1 NT W | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 7 90 4.00
27 1 s S | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 7 -80 3.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 63.00
Factored Total: 63.00

* Arrow switched table
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PLAYER SUMMARY FRM231201B - Fri Morning Blue - 1st Dec 2023 1/12/2023

Pair: 2 Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix
Your Posn is 4 with 50 % Top Score = 144
Board | Contract |By |Opponents Tricks | Score Points
1 3 NT S | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 10 -430 0.00
2 4 & E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 10 420 4.00
3 4 & W | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 9 -100 1.00
7 4 9 S | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 8 -200 4.00
8 4 & W | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 9 50 6.00
9 2 & N | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 7 -50 4.00
10 1 & N | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 8 -110 4.00
11 2 NT W | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 9 150 2.00
12 4 9 X N | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 8 500 6.00
13 5 & S | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 12 -620 2.00
14 3 NT S | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 10 -430 0.00
15 2 NT E | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 10 180 6.00
16 6 NT W | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 11 100 5.00
17 2 & S | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 9 140 4.00
18 3 NT E | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 10 -430 1.00
19 3 NT W | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 13 720 4.00
20 4 & E | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 10 620 4.00
21 Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden No Bid 2.00
22 2 NT N | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 10 180 2.00
23 4 9Q N | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 10 620 0.00
24 4 & E | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 9 50 4.00
25 4 9Q N | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 10 420 4.00
26 29 X S | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 5 -800 0.00
27 1 s S | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 7 80 3.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 72.00
Factored Total: 72.00

* Arrow switched table
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PLAYER SUMMARY FRM231201B - Fri Morning Blue - 1st Dec 2023 1/12/2023

Pair: 3  Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden
Your Posn is 2 with 59.02 % Top Score = 144
Board | Contract |By |Opponents Tricks | Score Points

1 2 0 E | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 8 -90 2.00
2 3 & W | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 11 -150 4.00
3 19 W | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 10 -130 2.00
4 2 & E | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 9 140 3.00
5 3 & E | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 10 130 5.00
6 3 & W | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 9 110 4.00
7 2 NT N | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 5 300 6.00
8 2 & W | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 8 110 4.00
9 29 E | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 8 90 4.00
13 39 S | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 10 -130 6.00
14 3 NT S | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 7 100 6.00
15 39 E | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 7 -100 1.00
16 2 NT E | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 11 210 5.00
17 2 & S | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 8 -110 4.00
18 1 NT E | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 6 -50 0.00
19 3 NT W | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 13 -720 2.00
20 4 & E | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 10 -620 2.00
21 Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix No Bid 4.00
22 3 NT N | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 11 -460 0.00
23 4 & S | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 12 -680 2.00
24 29 E | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 9 140 4.00
25 4 9Q N | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 10 420 4.00
26 3 NT W | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 8 100 5.00
27 2 9 E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 6 100 6.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 85.00
Factored Total: 85.00

* Arrow switched table
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PLAYER SUMMARY FRM231201B - Fri Morning Blue - 1st Dec 2023 1/12/2023

Pair: 4 Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood
Your Posn is 5with 45.13 % Top Score = 144
Board | Contract |By |Opponents Tricks | Score Points

1 5 & S | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 10 -50 4.00
2 3 NT X S | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 6 -800 0.00
3 2 NT W | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 11 -210 0.00
4 4 & E | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 11 -650 0.00
5 3 & N | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 8 -100 4.00
6 4 & W | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 8 200 6.00
7 4 9 S | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 8 200 2.00
8 4 & W | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 9 -50 0.00
9 2 & N | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 7 50 2.00
10 2 & W | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 5 -300 0.00
11 2 NT W | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 11 210 4.00
12 3 & E | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 9 140 2.00
13 3 NT N | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 13 720 6.00
14 3 NT S | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 9 400 4.00
15 3 NT E | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 7 100 5.00
16 2 NT E | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 11 210 5.00
17 2 & S | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 11 -200 0.00
18 3 NT W | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 10 430 5.00
19 3 NT W | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 12 690 0.00
20 2 & E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 9 140 2.00
21 Diane Murray & Susanne Hession No Bid 2.00
22 3 NT N | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 11 460 6.00
23 4 & S | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 12 680 4.00
24 2 9 E | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 9 -140 2.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 65.00
Factored Total: 65.00

* Arrow switched table
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PLAYER SUMMARY FRM231201B - Fri Morning Blue - 1st Dec 2023 1/12/2023

Pair: 6 Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl
Your Posn is 7 with 43.05 % Top Score = 144
Board | Contract |By |Opponents Tricks | Score Points
4 3 & E | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 9 140 3.00
5 39 W | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 6 -150 0.00
6 1 NT W | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 7 90 2.00
7 2 NT N | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 5 -300 0.00
8 2 & W | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 8 -110 2.00
9 2 0 E | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 8 -90 2.00
10 1 NT W | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 6 100 0.00
11 3 NT W | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 9 -400 0.00
12 2 & E | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 9 -140 4.00
13 3 NT N | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 13 -720 0.00
14 3 NT S | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 9 -400 2.00
15 3 NT E | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 7 -100 1.00
16 6 NT E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 11 -100 1.00
17 3 & E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 9 110 6.00
18 3 NT E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 9 400 2.00
19 3 NT W | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 13 -720 2.00
20 3 & W | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 8 100 6.00
21 Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly No Bid 4.00
22 3 NT N | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 8 50 6.00
23 4 & N | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 12 -680 2.00
24 4 9 E | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 11 450 6.00
25 4 9Q N | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 10 -420 2.00
26 29 X S | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 5 800 6.00
27 1 s S | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 7 -80 3.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 62.00
Factored Total: 62.00

* Arrow switched table

Printed 01/12/2023 Bridge Scoring Software V3.2.6 Page 5



PLAYER SUMMARY FRM231201B - Fri Morning Blue - 1st Dec 2023 1/12/2023

Pair: 7 Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin
Your Posn is 1 with 70.83 % Top Score = 144
Board | Contract |By |Opponents Tricks | Score Points

1 2 0 E | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 8 90 4.00
2 3 & W | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 11 150 2.00
3 19 W | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 10 130 4.00
4 3 & E | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 9 -140 3.00
5 39 W | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 6 150 6.00
6 1 NT W | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 7 -90 4.00
7 3 NT N | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 7 200 2.00
8 2 & W | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 9 140 6.00
9 3 NT E | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 10 630 6.00
10 2 & W | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 5 300 6.00
11 2 NT W | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 11 -210 2.00
12 3 & E | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 9 -140 4.00
13 5 & S | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 12 620 4.00
14 3 NT S | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 10 430 6.00
15 2 NT E | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 10 -180 0.00
19 3 NT W | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 13 720 4.00
20 4 & E | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 11 650 6.00
21 29 E | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 8 90 6.00
22 3 NT S | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 9 400 4.00
23 4 & S | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 12 680 4.00
24 6 NT E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 9 150 6.00
25 4 9Q N | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 9 50 6.00
26 4 9 E | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 9 -100 1.00
27 39 W | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 9 110 6.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 102.00
Factored Total: 102.00

* Arrow switched table
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PLAYER SUMMARY FRM231201B - Fri Morning Blue - 1st Dec 2023 1/12/2023

Pair: 8 Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly
Your Posn is 9 with 40.97 % Top Score = 144
Board | Contract |By |Opponents Tricks | Score Points
1 4 & N | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 8 100 6.00
2 2 NT W | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 8 120 0.00
3 4 & E | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 9 -100 1.00
4 4 & E | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 11 650 6.00
5 3 & N | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 8 100 2.00
6 4 & W | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 8 -200 0.00
7 3 NT N | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 7 -200 4.00
8 2 & W | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 9 -140 0.00
9 3 NT E | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 10 -630 0.00
10 1 NT N | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 8 -120 2.00
11 3 & E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 9 110 0.00
12 2 & E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 9 140 2.00
16 2 NT E | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 11 -210 1.00
17 2 & S | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 8 110 2.00
18 1 NT E | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 6 50 6.00
19 3 NT W | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 13 720 4.00
20 3 & W | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 8 -100 0.00
21 Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl No Bid 2.00
22 2 NT N | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 10 -180 4.00
23 4 9Q N | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 10 -620 6.00
24 4 & E | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 9 -50 2.00
25 4 9Q N | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 10 420 4.00
26 1 NT W | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 7 -90 2.00
27 1 s S | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 7 80 3.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 59.00
Factored Total: 59.00

* Arrow switched table
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PLAYER SUMMARY FRM231201B - Fri Morning Blue - 1st Dec 2023 1/12/2023

Pair: 9 Diane Murray & Susanne Hession
Your Posn is 3 with 55.55 % Top Score = 144
Board | Contract |By |Opponents Tricks | Score Points
1 3 NT S | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 10 430 6.00
2 4 & E | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 10 -420 2.00
3 4 & W | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 9 100 5.00
4 4 & E | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 9 -100 0.00
5 2 & E | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 10 130 5.00
6 2 NT E | Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith 8 120 6.00
10 1 NT N | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 8 120 4.00
11 3 & E | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 9 -110 6.00
12 2 & E | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 9 -140 4.00
13 39 S | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 12 -170 4.00
14 1 & N | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 7 -80 4.00
15 1 NT W | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 9 150 4.00
16 6 NT E | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 11 100 5.00
17 3 & E | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 9 -110 0.00
18 3 NT E | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 9 -400 4.00
19 3 NT W | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 12 -690 6.00
20 2 & E | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 9 -140 4.00
21 Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood No Bid 4.00
22 3 NT S | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 9 -400 2.00
23 4 & S | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 12 -680 2.00
24 6 NT E | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 9 -150 0.00
25 4 9Q N | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 10 -420 2.00
26 3 NT W | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 8 -100 1.00
27 2 9 E | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 6 -100 0.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 80.00
Factored Total: 80.00

* Arrow switched table
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PLAYER SUMMARY FRM231201B - Fri Morning Blue - 1st Dec 2023 1/12/2023

Pair: 10 Mary Rodda & Sandra Smith
Your Posn is 8 with 41.66 % Top Score = 144
Board | Contract |By |Opponents Tricks | Score Points
1 4 & N | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 8 -100 0.00
2 2 NT W | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 8 -120 6.00
3 4 & E | Brian Luxford & Jan Kelly 9 100 5.00
4 4 & E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 9 100 6.00
5 2 & E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 10 -130 1.00
6 2 NT E | Diane Murray & Susanne Hession 8 -120 0.00
7 3 NT N | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 7 -200 4.00
8 4 0 S | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 9 -50 4.00
9 1 & X N | Marie Wallis & Leonie Brien 7 160 6.00
10 1 & N | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 8 110 2.00
11 2 NT W | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 9 -150 4.00
12 4 V9 X N | Harry Malsem & Jenny Ellix 8 -500 0.00
13 39 S | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 10 130 0.00
14 3 NT S | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 7 -100 0.00
15 39 E | Sylvia Holloway & Liz Madden 7 100 5.00
16 2 NT E | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 11 -210 1.00
17 2 & S | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 11 200 6.00
18 3 NT W | Hugh Grady & Jean Kirkwood 10 -430 1.00
22 3 NT N | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 8 -50 0.00
23 4 & N | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 12 680 4.00
24 4 9 E | Lef Lazarou & Cheryle Leitl 11 -450 0.00
25 4 9Q N | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 9 -50 0.00
26 4 9 E | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 9 100 5.00
27 39 W | Yvonne McLaughlin & Chris McLaughlin 9 -110 0.00

Board Total (Incl. Ave's if applicable): 60.00
Factored Total: 60.00

* Arrow switched table
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